




50 CHAPTERS ON

THE TABERNACLE
Exodus 13

Leviticus 18
Numbers 13

Deuteronomy 2
Hebrews 4





Heb 8:5 serve as copy and shadow of the
heavenly things, as Moses was divinely
instructed when he was about to make
the tabernacle. For He said, “See that
you make all things according to the
pattern shown you on the mountain.”



• copy
• shadow
• parable
• stamp
• print
• analogy
• example
• figure





THE FURNITURE OF THE TABERNACLE



The Holy of Holies





The Holy of Holies





The Holy of Holies





The Holy of Holies



The Holy of Holies





The Holy of Holies





The Holy of Holies















Heb 9:24 For Christ has not entered the
holy places made with hands, which are
copies of the true, but into heaven itself,
now to appear in the presence of God for
us



Heb 10:19 Therefore, brethren, having 
boldness to enter the Holiest by the blood 
of Jesus, 
Heb 10:20 by a new and living way which 
He consecrated for us, through the veil, 
that is, His flesh, 
Heb 10:21 and having a High Priest over 
the house of God, 
Heb 10:22 let us draw near with a true 
heart in full assurance of faith



Heb 4:16 Let us therefore come boldly to
the throne of grace, that we may obtain
mercy and find grace to help in time of
need





Ex 25:8 And let them make Me a sanctuary, 
that I may dwell among them

Ex 25:9 According to all that I show you, 
that is, the pattern of the tabernacle and 
the pattern of all its furnishings, just so you 
shall make it.



Ex 25:10 And they shall make an ark of 
acacia wood, two and a half cubits shall be
its length, a cubit and a half its width, and a 
cubit and a half its height.

Ex 25:11 And you shall overlay it with pure 
gold, inside and out you shall overlay it, 
and shall make on it a molding of gold all 
around. 

45 x 27 x 27





Ex 25:13 And you shall make poles of
acacia wood, and overlay them with gold. 

Ex 25:14 You shall put the poles into the 
rings on the sides of the ark, that the ark 
may be carried by them. 

Ex 25:15 The poles shall be in the rings of 
the ark; they shall not be taken from it.



Ex 25:16 And you shall put into the ark the              
Testimony which I will give you.



Ex 25:16 And you shall put into the ark the              
Testimony which I will give you.

Hebrews 9:4



Ex 25:17 You shall make a mercy seat of 
pure gold; two and a half cubits shall be its 
length and a cubit and a half its width.

Ex 25:18 And you shall make two cherubim 
of gold; of hammered work you shall make 
them at the two ends of the mercy seat.

Ex 25:19 Make one cherub at one end, and 
the other cherub at the other end; you 
shall make the cherubim at the two ends of 
it of one piece with the mercy seat.



2 Kings 19:15 God of Israel, the One who 
dwells between the cherubim
Assyrians against Israel, Hezekiah prays

Is 37:16 O LORD of hosts, God of Israel, 
that dwellest between the cherubs, thou 
art the God, even thou alone

Ps 80:1 Shepherd leads Israel, dwells 
between the cherubim





Ex 25:20 And the cherubim shall stretch 
out their wings above, covering the mercy 
seat with their wings, and they shall face 
one another; the faces of the cherubim 
shall be toward the mercy seat.



Ex 25:21 You shall put the mercy seat on 
top of the ark, and in the ark you shall put 
the Testimony that I will give you



Ex 25:22 And there I will meet with you, 
and I will speak with you from above the 
mercy seat, from between the two 
cherubim which are on the ark of the 
Testimony, about everything which I will 
give you in commandment to the children 
of Israel.






